
The Unveiling of Gideon The Ninth - A
Mesmerizing Journey Through The Locked
Tomb
Are you ready to embark on an extraordinary adventure filled with mystery,
fantasy, and mind-bending twists? Look no further than Gideon The Ninth
by Tamsyn Muir - an innovative and gripping novel that will leave you
breathless and craving for more. In this article, we will delve deep into the
intricate world of Gideon The Ninth, exploring its captivating storyline,
unique characters, and the enigmatic Locked Tomb.

Unraveling the Plot

Gideon The Ninth takes place in a distant future where necromancers
harness powerful magic to achieve immortality. We follow the fearless
Gideon Nav, ready to do whatever it takes to escape her desolate planet
and achieve freedom. When she is unexpectedly summoned by the Ninth
House, one of the nine great necromantic houses, Gideon sees her chance
to break free. However, being selected by the Ninth House comes with a
price - she must serve as the cavalier to the mysterious Harrowhark
Nonagesimus, the Reverend Daughter of the Ninth House.

Together, Gideon and Harrowhark are thrust into a treacherous competition
against necromancers from other houses. They must solve a centuries-old
mystery within the eerie confines of the Locked Tomb, a labyrinthine
structure that hides deadly secrets. As alliances and rivalries blur, the duo
must overcome formidable adversaries and learn to trust each other in
order to survive. Their journey through the Locked Tomb unveils shocking
discoveries and unveils a greater threat to the entire universe.
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The Characters – A Blend of Complexity and Charm

Tamsyn Muir skillfully crafts a wide array of intriguing and multi-dimensional
characters throughout Gideon The Ninth. Gideon Nav, the irreverent and
witty protagonist, will win your heart with her sharp tongue and indomitable
spirit. Her complex relationship with Harrowhark, the haunted and
enigmatic necromancer, provides a rich backdrop for the unfolding
narrative.

Each necromantic house introduces a diverse cast of characters, each with
their own idiosyncrasies and motives. From the calculating characters of
the Eighth House to the flamboyant and eccentric members of the Fifth
House, every encounter leaves the reader yearning for more insight into
their alliances and rivalries.

The Enigma of the Locked Tomb

Central to the plot of Gideon The Ninth is the Locked Tomb, a mysterious
structure that holds the key to unlocking unimaginable power. As our
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protagonists venture deeper into its unfathomable depths, readers are
immersed in an eerie and captivating atmosphere. The labyrinthine
corridors, secret chambers, and cryptic symbols offer a feast for the
imagination.

The vivid descriptions of the Locked Tomb leave an indelible mark, evoking
a sense of wonder and curiosity. Each step towards uncovering the secrets
hidden within its walls fuels the anticipation, making it impossible to put the
book down. It is a testament to Tamsyn Muir's exceptional storytelling ability
that she can seamlessly blend suspense and fascination in such a nuanced
way.

The Impact – A Game-Changer in the Fantasy Genre

Gideon The Ninth has garnered critical acclaim and a devoted following
within the fantasy genre. Tamsyn Muir's skillful world-building, combined
with her distinctive writing style, has set a new standard for the genre. This
novel is an unparalleled exploration of necromancy, fantasy, and the bonds
that form in the most unexpected places.

Prepare to be enthralled by the beautifully constructed narrative, the
complexity of the characters, and the hidden depths of the Locked Tomb.
Get ready to witness a masterfully crafted story that will keep you on the
edge of your seat, hungry for more.

Gideon The Ninth: The Locked Tomb invites readers to immerse
themselves in a world where necromancers harness unimaginable power
and a deadly competition unravels more than they bargained for. Tamsyn
Muir's masterful storytelling, intricate characters, and gripping plotline will



leave you breathless and eagerly anticipating the next installment in this
mesmerizing series.
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Gideon the Ninth is the first book in the New York Times and USA Today
Bestselling Locked Tomb Series, and one of the Best Books of 2019
according to NPR, the New York Public Library, Amazon, BookPage, Shelf
Awareness,BookRiot, and Bustle!
WINNER of the 2020 Locus Award and Crawford Award
Finalist for the 2020 Hugo, Nebula, Dragon, and World Fantasy Awards

“Unlike anything I’ve ever read. ” —V.E. Schwab

“Lesbian necromancers explore a haunted gothic palace in space!” —
Charles Stross
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“Deft, tense and atmospheric, compellingly immersive and wildly original.”
—The New York Times

The Emperor needs necromancers.

The Ninth Necromancer needs a swordswoman.

Gideon has a sword, some dirty magazines, and no more time for undead
nonsense.

Tamsyn Muir’s Gideon the Ninth unveils a solar system of swordplay, cut-
throat politics, and lesbian necromancers. Her characters leap off the page,
as skillfully animated as arcane revenants. The result is a heart-pounding
epic science fantasy.

Brought up by unfriendly, ossifying nuns, ancient retainers, and countless
skeletons, Gideon is ready to abandon a life of servitude and an afterlife as
a reanimated corpse. She packs up her sword, her shoes, and her dirty
magazines, and prepares to launch her daring escape. But her childhood
nemesis won’t set her free without a service.

Harrowhark Nonagesimus, Reverend Daughter of the Ninth House and
bone witch extraordinaire, has been summoned into action. The Emperor
has invited the heirs to each of his loyal Houses to a deadly trial of wits and
skill. If Harrowhark succeeds she will be become an immortal, all-powerful
servant of the Resurrection, but no necromancer can ascend without their
cavalier. Without Gideon’s sword, Harrow will fail, and the Ninth House will
die.

Of course, some things are better left dead.
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